
Anna Juingst
Oct. 7, 1854 – June 24, 1939

Mrs. Anna Juingst, 84 Years Old, Dies; Conduct Last Rites
Aged Citizen of Monticello - Summoned After Long Period of Illness 

Funeral services for Mrs. Anna Juingst, 84 years of age, life-long resident of Green county, 
who passed away at her home on Monroe street at 8:30 Saturday morning following a period 
of failing health which had its inception nearly three years ago, were conducted at 2 Monday 
afternoon in the home. 

Rev. A. R. Achtemeier, pastor of the Zwingli Evangelical and Reformed church, officiated. 
Interment was in Highland cemetery. Pallbearers were Clarence. W. Loveland, Richard Smith 
and James Holcomb, Washington township, Donald Knobel, Monticello, and Oscar and 
Maynard Losey, Winslow, Ill. 

Ill Many Months

Mrs. Juingst first began to fail about three years ago and for approximately two and one-
half years was under the care of a trained nurse, 

Washington Native

Anna Blum was a native of Washington township, having been born Oct. 7, 1854, the 
daughter of Fridolin and Dorothy Stuessy Blum. She was born on the homestead farm, now 
occupied by Rudy Feller. She received her education in the rural schools in Washington 
township. On Jan. 13, 1878, she was united in marriage to Henry Juingst, the ceremony taking 
place in Milwaukee. After residing in Milwaukee for one year following their marriage the 
couple came to Monticello, settling on a farm in Washington township, now owned by John 
Hammerly. In 1899 they moved to Monticello where they continued to reside. 

Mrs. Juingst was a member of the Zwingli Evangelical and Reformed church, of this village. 

Comes as Shock

Although it was generally known that Mrs. Juingst was very ill the past week’s news of her 
death came as a severe shock to her large number of friends and acquaintances in the village 
and elsewhere, 

Surviving are three daughters, Mrs. Albert Knobel and Mrs. Emily Jordan, Monticello, and 
Mrs. Roscoe Smith, Washington township; three brothers, Fred S. Blum, Monticello, Sam 
Blum, Monroe, and John Blum, Hampton, Iowa; two sisters, Mrs. Rudy Wild, Belleville, and 
Mrs. Kate Fischley, Milwaukee; six grandchildren and eight great-grandchildren. Mrs, 
Juingst’s husband passed away Dec. 5, 1938. She was also preceded in death by her parents, 
one daughter in infancy; a brother, Ed Blum, Monticello, and a sister, Mrs. James Pierce, also 
of Monticello.


